MADISON]|

=277 PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

To:
From:

Subject:

Madison County Board of Supervisors
146 West Center Street
Canton, MS 39046 / 601-855-5534
kesha.jackson@madison-co.com

September 6, 2022

Board of Supervisors

Kesha Jackson, Purchasing Clerk %
Award Commodity Term Bids

Attached are copies of recently-opened commodity term bids and spreadsheet tabulations.

I recommend that the Board take the following actions:

(A) Acknowledge all bids received;

(B) Reject lone gravel bid & authorize to re-advertise gravel term bid;

(C) Award Commodity Term Bids

l.

Award the Term Bid for SC1-Type 8 Asphalt for the period of October 1, 2022 —
September 30, 2023 to ADCAMP at $89.09 per ton.

Award the First Alternate Term Bid for SC1-Type 8 Asphalt for the period of October
1, 2022 — September 30, 2023 to APAC-Canton at $102.35 per ton.

Award the Term Bid for SC1-Type 2 Asphalt for the period of October 1, 2022 —
September 30, 2023 to ADCAMP at $88.09 per ton.

Award the First Alternate Term Bid for SC1-Type 2 Asphalt for the period of October
1, 2022 — September 30, 2023 to Dickerson & Bowen at $96.37 per ton.

Award the Term Bid for CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt for the period of October 1, 2022 —
September 30, 2023 to Ergon at $4.30 per gallon.

Award the Term Bid for Cold Mix Asphalt for the period of October 1, 2022 —
September 30, 2023 to AJ Construction at $171.24 per ton.



7. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for Cold Mix Asphalt for the period of October 1,
2022 — September 30, 2023 to Dickerson & Bowen at $180.77 per ton.

8. Award the Term Bid for BB-1 Asphalt for the period of October 1, 2022 — September
30, 2023 to ADCAMP at $85.09 per ton.

9. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for BB-1 Asphalt for the period of October 1,
2022 — September 30, 2023 to Dickerson & Bowen at $89.82 per ton.

10. Award the Term Bid for 12” Diameter by Foot HDPE (Plastic Pipe) for the period of
October 1, 2022 — September 30, 2023 to G&O Supply at $12.23.

11. Award the Term Bid for 15” Diameter by Foot HDPE (Plastic Pipe) for the period of
October 1, 2022 — September 30, 2023 to G&O Supply at $13.58.

12. Award the Term Bid for 18” Diameter by Foot HDPE (Plastic Pipe) for the period of
October 1, 2022 — September 30, 2023 to G&O Supply at $17.38.

13. Award the Term Bid for 24” Diameter by Foot HDPE (Plastic Pipe) for the period of
October 1, 2022 — September 30, 2023 to G&O Supply at $29.34.

14. Award the Term Bid for 30” Diameter by Foot HDPE (Plastic Pipe) for the period of
October 1, 2022 — September 30, 2023 to G&O Supply at $41.29.

15. Award Term Bid for 24” Band HDPE (Plastic Pipe) for the period of October 1, 2022
— September 30, 2023 to G&O Supply at $80.00.

16. Award Term Bid for 30” Band HDPE (Plastic Pipe) for the period of October 1, 2022
— September 30, 2023 to G&O Supply at $155.00.

17. Award Term Bid for 24” Diameter by Foot Aluminized CMP for the period of
October 1, 2022 — September 30, 2023 to G&O Supply at $52.34.

18. Award Term Bid for 30” Diameter by Foot Aluminized CMP for the period of
October 1, 2022 — September 30, 2023 to G&O Supply at $65.42.

19. Award Term Bid for 24” Band Aluminized CMP for the period of October 1, 2022 —
September 30, 2023 to G&O Supply at $157.02.

20. Award Term Bid for 30” Band Aluminized CMP for the period of October 1, 2022 —
September 30, 2023 to G&O Supply at $196.26.

Thank you in advance for your consideration of the above recommendations.



ASPHALT TABULATION FOR TERM BID PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2022 TO SEPTEMBER 30, 2023

SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt

Miles to Road Department (Source: Bing maps)

SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt Bid Price

Round trip miles

X $2.01 per mile freight cost

Freight cost per ton (per mile cost/average tons per load)
Cost per ton picked-up (commodity price plus freight)

SC 1 Type 2 Asphalt

Miles to Road Department (Source: Bing maps)

SC 1 Type 2 Asphalt Bid Price

Round trip miles

X $2.01 per mile freight cost

Freight cost per ton (per mile cost/average tons per load)
Cost per ton picked-up (commodity price plus freight)

BB 1

Miles to Road Department (Source: Bing maps)

BB 1 ASPHALT BID PRICE

Round trip miles

X $2.01 per mile freight cost

Freight cost per ton (per mile cost/average tons per load)
Cost per ton picked-up (commodity price plus freight)

COLD MIX

Miles to Road Department (Source: Bing maps)

COLD MIX ASPHALT BID PRICE

Round trip miles

X $2.01 per mile freight cost

Freight cost per ton (per mile cost/average tons per load)
Cost per ton picked-up (commaodity price plus freight)

APAC
Canton
1.5
$102.00
3
$6.03
$0.35
$102.35

APAC
Canton
1.5
$98.50
3
$6.03
$0.35
$98.85

APAC
Canton
1.5
$91.00
3
$6.03
$0.35
$91.35

APAC
Jackson
29

$104.00
58
$116.58
$4.49
$108.49

APAC
Jackson
29
$96.00
58
$116.58
$6.70
$102.70

APAC
Jackson
29
$92.50
58
$116.58
$6.70
$99.20

APAC
Jackson

29
$168.00
192
$385.92
$22.18
$190.18

Dickerson ADCAMP AJ
Bowen Rankin  Construction
28 35 27
$102.75 $81.00 $98.00
56 70 54
$112.56 $140.70 $108.54
$6.47 $8.09 $6.24
$109.22 $89.09 $104.24
Dickerson ADCAMP AJ
Bowen Rankin  Construction
28 35 27
$89.90 $80.00 $93.25
56 70 54
$112.56 $140.70 $108.54
$6.47 $8.09 $6.24
$96.37 $88.09 $99.49
Dickerson ADCAMP AJ
Bowen Rankin  Construction
28 35 27
$83.35 $77.00 $93.25
56 70 o4
$112.56 $140.70 $108.54
$6.47 $8.09 $6.24
$89.82 $85.09 $99.49
Dickerson AJ
Bowen Construction
28 27
$160.00 $165.00
179.8 54
$361.40 $108.54
$20.77 $6.24
$180.77 $171.24



Home Administrators Site Members Page Creator Hit Statistics Agenda Builder Planning and Zoning Archives Logout

Menu s Planning and Zoning Bid Tool Email Manager Help Bid Tool
Create New Bid
View Pending Bids Show 10 v entries Search:
View Open Bids . 1
y . i Bid View |
;uew globs:dLBsds D Name :Phone Email Company Name Date Submitted |Amount [Bid ‘
1ew Fublic Log 2653 | Adam (513)666- | dodge.bidding@construction.com | Dodge Data & Analytics | 07-25-2022 $0.00 ‘
Bid System Log Bouman 3354 05:30:08 pm |
Permissions 2654 |Adam (513) 666- |dodge.bidding@construction.com | Dodge Data & Analytics |07-25-2022 $0.00
Current Time: 08-30-2022 09:27:00 Bouman 3354 I D 05:30:52 pm s
am | 2656 |Morgan (800) 364- |content@constructconnect.com ConstructConnect 08-03-2022 $0.00
Stinson 2059 ) R - 05:14:28 am o
2657 | Teresa (601) 933- |teresa.purifoy@ergon.com Ergon Asphalt & 08-16-2022 $0.00 View
Purifoy 3387 Emulsions 01:20:28 pm Bid .
2658 |Blake Clarke | (601) 969- |bclarke@dickerscnandbowen.com | Dickersen and Bowen, |08-16-2022 $0.00 View |
2002 Inc. 04:11:39 pm Bid !
2659 {Terry May  {(601) 376- |john.may@apac.com APAC-Mississippi, INC {08-17-2022 $0.00 View |
4000 05:10:49 pm Bid
2660 |Ky Lowery | (601) 376- |danny.lowery@apac.com APAC Mississippi Inc. | 08-17-2022 $0.00 View
4036 05:12:53 pm Bid

Showing 1 to 7 of 7 entries
Provious 1 Next

Switch to Advanced View
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MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
CONSTRUCTION SERVICES
TERM BIDS FORPERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2022-SEPTEMBER 30,2023

SPECIFICATIONS

ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The Madison County Board of Supervisors will receive sealed bids for the following:
Construction Services:

Haul and Laydown of Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of SC-I, Type 8 Asphalt
Haul and Laydown of 9.5 mm Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of BB-I Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of 12 mm Asphalt

Road Base Repair

Base Repair of up to 11" depth
Base Repair of 11-24" depth

. Cold Mill

Cold Milling, All Depths, County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement
Cold Milling, All Depths, Vendor removes Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

Commodities:

Asphait

SC1-Type 8
SC1-Type 2

CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt
Cold Mix Asphalt
BB1

Gravel
610unwashed limestone aggregate

#7 washed limestone aggregate
#57 washed limestone aggregate
#89 washed limestone aggregate
#100 Rip Rap

#200 Rip Rap

#300 Rip Rap

Page 10f 10
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Washed Road Gravel
Clay Gravel

HDPE (Plastic Pipes)
12 diameter by foot

15" diameter by foot
18" diameter by foot

24” diameter by foot
30" diameter by foot
24"Band
30”Band

24” diameter by foot
30” diameter by foot
24” Band
30” Band

Sealed Bids may be submitted by either of the following methods:

Sealed Bids will be accepted until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 18, 2022, by electronic
submission at http://www.madison-co.com/bids or in a sealed envelope at the Chancery
Clerk's Office, 125 West North Street, Canton, Mississippi.

Electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 18, 2022, as a PDF
file via Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids. Each bidder
submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's bid sheet as
part of its PDF bid submittal.

Non-electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on August 18, 2022 at the Madison
County Chancery Clerk's Office, Rooms 225-228,125 West North Street, Canton, MS
39046. All sealed bids submitted to the Chancery Clerk's office shall have the bidder's name
and the phrase “Term Bid” for which a bid is being submitted written on the outside face of
the envelope. If any envelope is not so marked, said bid shall not be opened and considered.
Each bidder submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's
bid sheet as part of its PDF bid submittal.
All bids must comply with the specifications provided. Madison County reserves the
right to amend the specifications, as necessary, and agrees to notify all who have
requested bid packets from the Madison County Board of Supervisors. No Guaranteed
ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED, DATED AND
SUBMITTED ON THE COUNTY FURNISHED BID FORMS

The Madison County Board of Supervisors reserves the right to reject any and all bids,
and to waive any informalities or irregularities in the bids received. For any questions
relating to the electronic submission process, please call Kesha Jackson at
601.855.5534.

Madison County Board of Supervisors
By: (s) Kesha Jackson, Purchase Clerk Publication Dates: July 21, 2022 & July 28, 2022

Madison County Journal
Page 2 of 10
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Commodity Term Bid

Asphalt
Asphalt
SC1-Type 8
SC1-Type 2
CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt
Cold Mix Asphalt

BBI

$81.00

$80.00
NO BID
NO BID

$77.00

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

(v')yMark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initi?/ﬂyljatc 08/18/2022

Page 6 of 10



Commodity Term Bid

Gravel

2. Gravel

a. 610unwashed limestone aggregate bid amount
b. #7washed limestone aggregate bid amount
c. #57washed limestone aggregate bid amount
d. #89 washed limestone aggregate bid amount
e. #l00Rip Rap bid amount
f.  #200Rip Rap bid amount
g. #300Rip Rap bid amount
h. Washed Road Gravel bid amount
i. Clay Gravel bid amount

v (v") Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

I.nitialzéépate 08/18/2022

Page 7 of 10



Commodity Term Bid

HDPE (Plastic Pipes)

3. HDPE (Plastic Pipes)

a. 12” diameter by foot bid amount
b. 15" diameter by foot bid amount
c. 18” diameter by foot bid amount
d. 24” diameter by foot bid amount
e. 307 diameter by foot bid amount
f. 24”Band bid amount
g. 30”Band bid amount

v (v )Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initia Date 08/19/2022
\

Page 8 of 10



Commodity Term Bid

Aluminized CMP (Pipes) (14 Gauge Type 2)

luminized i 14 Gauge Type 2
24” diameter by foot bid amount
30 diameter by foot bid amount
24” Band bid amount
30” Band bid amount

v/ (v")Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initi?/ Date 08/18/2022

Page 9 of 10



For use in your calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the Number of
Miles from your Company Plant to the Madison County Road Department
Miles

NOTE: ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED
BY ANAUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a term bid by the Madison
County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the materials or services on this bid form,
that it will provide said materials or services in a timely manner at the awarded term bid
price for the duration of said term bid period. The company acknowledges there are

No Minimum Guarantees on any term bid. The below signed company further agrees
that it will not provide quantities of a materials or services in an amount greater than is
listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed
company agrees that if it does provide materials or services in an amount greater than
that listed on the purchase order, that it will not hold Madison County responsible for
the quantity of such materials or services that exceeds the purchase order amount.

Company Name: ADCAMP, INC.

Address: (PHYSICAL) 1353 FLOWOOD DR., FLOWOOD, MS 39232

L -4246
Telephone #: 601-939-4493
Cell Phone#: 601-940-1343
Fax#: 601-940-4676
Email: ralph@adcampinc.com

Authorized Representative’s Signap@*—ﬁ-«— Mte AUGUST 18, 2022

Print Authorized Representative’s Name_ RALPH BARNES, PRESIDENT

The specifications and bid forms for the above-listed term bids are on file and
open for public inspection at the Madison County Chancery Clerk's Office,
Rooms 225-228, and 125 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. A PDF copy of
the specifications and bid sheets may be procured, at no charge, by either of the
following methods:

. Download acopy from Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids

. Email arequest to kesha.jackson@madison-co.com

nitial /() Date 08/18/2022

4

Page 10 of 10
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MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
CONSTRUCTION SERVICES

TERM BIDS FORPERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2022-SEPTEMBER 30,2023
SPECIFICATIONS

ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The Madison County Board of Supervisors will receive sealed bids for the following:
Construction Services:

Haul and Laydown of Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of SC-I, Type 8 Asphalt
Haul and Laydown of 9.5 mm Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of BB-I Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of 12mm Asphalt

Road Base Repair

Base Repair of up to 11" depth
Base Repair of 11-24" depth

. Cold Milli

Cold Milling, All Depths, County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement
Cold Milling, All Depths, Vendor removes Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

Commodities:

Asphalt

SC1-Type 8
SC1-Type 2

CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt
Cold Mix Asphalt
BBI

Gravel

610unwashed limestone aggregate
#7 washed limestone aggregate
#57 washed limestone aggregate
#89 washed limestone aggregate
#100 Rip Rap

#200 Rip Rap

#300 Rip Rap

Page 1 of 10
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Washed Road Gravel
Clay Gravel

HDPE (Plastic Pipes)
12" diameter by foot

15" diameter by foot

18” diameter by foot

24" diameter by foot

30" diameter by foot
24”Band

30" Band

\luminized CMP (Pipes) (14 G Type 2
24” diameter by foot

30” diameter by foot
24” Band
30” Band

Sealed Bids may be submitted by either of the following methods:

Sealed Bids will be accepted until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 18, 2022, by electronic
submission at http://www.madison-co.com/bids or in a sealed envelope at the Chancery
Clerk's Office, 125 West North Street, Canton, Mississippi.

Electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 18, 2022, as a PDF
file via Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids. Each bidder
submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's bid sheet as
part of its PDF bid submittal.

Non-electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on August 18, 2022 at the Madison
County Chancery Clerk's Office, Rooms 225-228,125 West North Street, Canton, MS
39046. All sealed bids submitted to the Chancery Clerk's office shall have the bidder's name
and the phrase “Term Bid” for which abid is being submitted written on the outside face of
the envelope. If any envelope is not so marked, said bid shall not be opened and considered.
Each bidder submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's
bid sheet as part of its PDF bid submittal.
All bids must comply with the specifications provided. Madison County reserves the
right to amend the specifications, as necessary, and agrees to notify all who have
requested bid packets from the Madison County Board of Supervisors. No Guaranteed
Minimum.
ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED, DATED AND
SUBMITTED ON THE COUNTY FURNISHED BID FORMS

The Madison County Board of Supervisors reserves the right to reject any and all bids,
and to waive any informalities or irregularities in the bids received. For any questions
relating to the electronic submission process, please call Kesha Jackson at
601.855.5534.

Madison County Board of Supervisors
By: (s) Kesha Jackson, Purchase Clerk Publication Dates: July 21, 2022 & July 28, 2022

Madison County Journal

Page 2 of 10



Commodity Term Bid

Asphalt
1. Asphalt
SCI1-Type 8 5ﬂ:q&w ~_bid amount
b. SCI-Type 2 &652{ bid amount
CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt A’A bid amount
Cold Mix Asphalt &% WeS.°®  bid amount

BB1 bid amount

(v )Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

InitialéC~ Date 5{[8{1021.
6@&\ Page 6 of 10




Commodity Term Bid

Gravel

Gravel

610 unwashed limestone aggregate

#7 washed limestone aggregate
#57 washed limestone aggregate
#89 washed limestone aggregate
#100 Rip Rap

#200 Rip Rap

#300 Rip Rap

Washed Road Gravel

Clay Gravel

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

“bid amount

~ bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

\/ (v )Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial £~ Date () [\B| 2022

Page 7 of 10



3. HDPE (Plastic Pipes)

a. 127 diameter by foot

b. 157" diameter by foot

c. 18" diameter by foot

d. 24" diameter by foot

e. 307 diameter by foot

f. 24”Band

30” Band

s

Commodity Term Bid

HDPE (Plastic Pipes)

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

__bid amount

\/ (v )Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial “<— Date ﬁLﬁluu

gl

Page 8 of 10



d.

Commodity Term Bid

Aluminized CMP (Pipes) (14 Gauge Type 2)

iniz MP (Pi

24" diameter by foot

30 diameter by foot

24” Band

30" Band

14

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

\/ (v yMark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial £94~Date

B . ;‘Sl o

Page 9 of 10
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For use in your calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the Number of

Miles from your Company Plant to the Madison County Road Department
271 Miles

NOTE: ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED
BY ANAUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a term bid by the Madison
County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the materials or services on this bid form,
that it will provide said materials or services in a timely manner at the awarded term bid
price for the duration of said term bid period. The company acknowledges there are

No Minimum Guarantees on any term bid. The below signed company further agrees
that it will not provide quantities of a materials or services in an amount greater than is
listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed
company agrees that if it does provide materials or services in an amount greater than
that listed on the purchase order, that it will not hold Madison County responsible for
the quantity of such materials or services that exceeds the purchase order amount.

Company Name: AS COA"amocﬁ:oA‘, _C.
Address: P.O. Box. 2024

W‘ll-’dosz-f\= ms FHiso
Telephone #: (20 |- 1T le - ]2 82
Cell Phonet#: (20|~ 3F3- 3440
Fax#:
Email: <@ ( ATC- mS. omn

Authorized Representative’s Signature égﬂn Dateﬂ‘mlm

Print Authorized Representative’s Name o= Cm’ﬁﬂ

The specifications and bid forms for the above-listed term bids are on file and
open for public inspection at the Madison County Chancery Clerk's Office,
Rooms 225-228, and 125 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. A PDF copy of
the specifications and bid sheets may be procured, at no charge, by either of the
following methods:

Download a copy from Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids

Email a request to kesha.jackson@madison-co.com

Initial &€~ DateB|18lzo2z2

@4\ Page 10 of 10



APAC-Mississippl, Inc.
P.0. Box 24508
Jackson, Mississippi 392254508

Certificate of Responsibility Number 95

Privilege Tax License Number
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MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
CONSTRUCTION SERVICES
TERM BIDS FORPERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2022-SEPTEMBER 30,2023

SPECIFICATIONS

ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The Madison County Board of Supervisors will receive sealed bids for the following:

Construction Services:

Haul and Laydewn of Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of SC-I, Type 8 Asphalt
Haul and Laydown of 9.5 mm Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of BB-I Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of 12 mm Asphalt

Road Base Repair

Base Repair of up to II" depth
Base Repair of 11-24" depth
Cold Milli

Cold Milling, All Depths, County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement
Cold Milling, All Depths, Vendor removes Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

Commodities:

Asphalt

. SCI-Type 8

SCl-Type 2

CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt
Cold Mix Asphalt
BB1..

Gravel |
610 mwashed limestone aggregate
#7 washed limestone aggregate

#57 washedlimestone aggregate

#89 washed limestone aggregate
#100 Rip Rap
#200 Rip Rap
#300Rip Rap

Page 1 0of 10
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Washed Road Gravel
Clay Gravel

HDPE (Plastic Pipes)
12" diameter by foot
15" diameter by foot
18” diameter by foot

24” diameter by foot
30” diameter by foot
24" Band
30"Band

Aluminized CMP (Pipes) (14 Gauge Type 2)
24” diameter by foot

30” diameter by foot
24” Band
30”Band

Sealed Bids may be submitted by either of the following methods:

Sealed Bids will be accepted until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 18, 2022, by electronic
submission at http://www.madison-co.com/bids or in a sealed envelope at the Chancery
Clerk's Office, 125 West North Street, Canton, Mississippi.

Electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 18, 2022, as a PDF
file via Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids. Each bidder
submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's bid sheet as
part of its PDF bid submittal.

Non-electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on August 18, 2022 at the Madison
County Chancery Clerk's Office, Rooms 225-228,125 West North Street, Canton, MS
39046. All sealed bids submitted to the Chancery Clerk's office shall have the bidder's name
and the phrase “Term Bid» for which abid is being submitted written on the outside face of
the envelope. If any envelope is not so marked, said bid shall not be opened and considered.
Each bidder submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's
bid sheet as part of its PDF bid submittal.
All bids must comply with the specifications provided. Madison County reserves the
right to amend the specifications, as necessary, and agrees to notify all who have
requested bid packets from the Madison County Board of Supervisors. No Guaranteed
Minimum.,
ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED, DATED AND
SUBMITTED ON THE COUNTY FURNISHED BID FORMS

The Madison County Board of Supervisors reserves the right to reject any and all bids,
and to waive any informalities or irregularities in the bids received. For any questions
relating to the electronic submission process, please call Kesha Jackson at
601.855.5534.

Madison County Board of Supervisors
By: (s) Kesha Jackson, Purchase Clerk Publication Dates: July 21, 2022 & July 28, 2022

Madison County Journal

Page 2 of 10



Commodity Term Bid

Asphalt
1. Asphalt
a. SCl-Type 8 (ZZ @bid amount
b. SCI1-Type2 ch .'SBbid amount
c. CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt —/¥#4 — bid amount
d. Cold Mix Asphalt ’% bid amount
e. BBI Q/ £ bid amount

(v')Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

(i~ e pand Voo™

A

Initial Date

Page 6 of 10



Commodity Term Bid

Gravel
2. Qluejg
b74Y e

*‘ a. unwashed limestone aggregate =3g bid amount

b. #7washedlimestone aggregate __ Nrx bid amount
. e ..

* c. #57 washed limestone aggregate ,5 91 -~ bid amount
d. #89 washedlimestone aggregate dﬁ bid amount
e. #100RipRap /YA bid amount
f. #200Rip Rap N4 bid amount
g. #300RipRap /¥4 bid amount
h. WashedRoad Gravel Nr3  bid amount
i. Clay Gravel AJ/A _ bid amount

(v")yMark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

3 = pnaere) Yo locded o Adacts Viddsbur e Stone Yare,

Initial Date

Page 7 of 10



Commodity Term Bid

HDPE (Plastic Pipes)

. HDPE (Plastic Pipes)
12” diameter by foot bid amount
. 15” diameter by foot bid amount
18” diameter by foot , bid amount
.07 diametcf by foot . bid amount
. 30" diameter by foot . 1 bidamount
24" Band | bidamount
. 30”Band | _ | bid amount

l/ (v’)Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial Date

Page 8 of 10



Commodity Term Bid

/
Aluminized CMP (Pipes) (14 Gauge Type 2)

inized C i 4 Gauge Type 2
. 24” diameter by foot 1 bid amount
. 30” diameter by foot | bid amount
. 24”Band | bid amount
. 30”Band 1 bid amount

l/ (v')Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial Date

Page 9 of 10



For use in your calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the Number of
Miles from your Company Plant to the Madison County Road Department
L5 Miles

L4

NOTE: ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED
BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a term bid by the Madison
County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the materials or services on this bid form,
that it will provide said materials or services in a timely manner at the awarded term bid
price for the duration of said term bid period. The company acknowledges there are

No Minimum Guarantees on any term bid. The below signed company further agrees
that it will not provide quantities of a materials or services in an amount greater than is
listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed
company agrees that if it does provide materials or services in an amount greater than
that listed on the purchase order, that it will not hold Madison County responsible for
the quantity of such materials or services that exceeds the purchase order amount.

Company Name: /A ~/A35/55, : Zne,
Address: / % 5&)6 Zf5h8
Jacksoy b _S57225-¢s08
Telephone #: ___ 60]- B74- +/poo
Cell Phoneits___ ol T54- Bl
Faxt: __ (o) S- 4055
e ___john.imey @ dpzomt o ,
Authorized Representative’s Signature y o d Date 5 V72022

. o o / /ﬂ
Print Authorized Representative’s Name__ erzy. itl

The specifications and bid forms for the above-listed term bids are on file and
open for public inspection at the Madison County Chancery Clerk's Office,
Rooms 225-228, and 125 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046, A PDF copy of
the specifications and bid sheets may be procured, atno charge, by either of the
following methods:

. Download a copy from Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids

. Email arequest to kesha jackson@madison-co.com

Initial Date

Page 10 of 10



APAC-Misslssippi Inc.
P.O. Box 24508
Jackson, Mississippi 39225-4508

Certificate of Responsibility Number 95
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MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
CONSTRUCTION SERVICES
TERMBIDS FORPERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2022-SEPTEMBER 30,2023

SPECIFICATIONS

ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The Madison County Board of Supervisors will receive sealed bids for the following:

Construction Services:

Haul and Laydown of Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of SC-I, Type 8 Asphalt
Haul and Laydown of 9.5 mm Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of BB-I Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of 12 mm Asphalt

Road Base Repair |

Base Repair of up to 11" depth
Base Repair of 11-24" depth
Cold Milli

Cold Milling, All Depths, County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement
Cold Milling, All Depths, Vendor removes Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

Commodities:

Asphalt

- SCI1-Type 8

SCI1-Type 2

CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt
Cold Mix Asphalt
BBi..

ave
610 imwashed limestone aggregate
#7 washed limestone aggregate

. #57 washed limestone aggregate

#89 washed limestone aggregate
#100 Rip Rap
#200 Rip Rap
#300 Rip Rap

Page 10f10




Commodity Term Bid

Asphalt
1. Asphalt
o
a. SC1-Type 8 Zﬂ }l bid amount
’ oy
b. SCI-Type 2 9@ —_ bid amount
c. CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt AA  bid amount
@
d. Cold Mix Asphalt g’é& ~  bid amount

o
e. BBI EZ ~ bid amount

(v")Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Jodeon f\m\\;ﬁ' \scats

Initial Date

Page 6 of 10



Commodity Term Bid

. Gravel

. 610unwashed limestone aggregate

. #7washed limestone aggregate

. #57 washed limestone aggregate
. #89 washed 1imesto11e aggregate
. #100 Rip Rz;p

#200 Rip Rap

. #300 Rip Rap

. Washed Road Gravel

Clay Gravel

Gravel

| bid amount

| bid amount

| bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

‘/ (v'yMark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial Date

Page 7 of 10



ipes
12” diameter by foot

. 15” diameter by foot

18” diameter by foot

. 24” diameter by foot
. 30” diameter by foot
24" Band

. 30”Band

i

Initial Date

Commodity Term Bid

HDPE (Plastic Pipes)

bid amount

| bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

| _____bid amount

bid amount

——

(v')Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Page 8 of 10



Commodity Term Bid

Aluminized CMP (Pipes) (14 Gauge Type 2)

luminized CMP (Pipe 4 Gauge

. 24” diameter by foot

. 30” diameter by foot

. 24” Band

. 30”Band

e

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

/( v’y Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial

Date

Page 9 of 10



For use in your calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the Number of
Miles ofxéo?m your Company Plant to the Madison County Road Department
Miles

NOTE: ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED
BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a term bid by the Madison
County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the materials or services on this bid form,
that it will provide said materials or services in a timely manner at the awarded term bid
price for the duration of said term bid period. The company acknowledges there are

No Minimum Guarantees on any term bid. The below signed company further agrees
that it will not provide quantities of a materials or services in an amount greater than is
listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed
company agrees that if it does provide materials or services in an amount greater than
that listed on the purchase order, that it will not hold Madison County responsible for
the quantity of such materials or services that exceeds the purchase order amount.

Company Name: - f/ ..’6/55/&//. I C,

address: L. Box A &7
Ll Mo 372254508

Telephone #: éd/ -3 74 4/&90

Cell Phonet:___ &0/~ 764-E76¢

Fax#: (90/ "37é 4&65

Authorized Representative’s Signature Date %

Print Authorized Representative’s Name__

The specifications and bid forms for the above-listed term b1ds are on file and
open for public inspection at the Madison County Chancery Clerk's Office,
Rooms 225-228, and 125 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. A PDF copy of
the specifications and bid sheets may be procured, atno charge, by either of the
following methods:

http://www.madison-co.com/bids

. Email arequest to kesha jackson@madison-co.com

Initial Date

Page 10 of 10
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MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
CONSTRUCTION SERVICES
TERM BIDS FOR PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2022-SEPTEMBER 30,2023
SPECIFICATIONS

ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The Madison County Board of Supervisors will receive sealed bids for the following:
Construction Services:

Haul and Laydown of Asphalt
Haul and Laydown of SC-I, Type 8 Asphalt
Haul and Laydown of 9.5 mm Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of BB-1 Asphalt
Haul and Laydown of 12mm Asphalt

Road Base Repair

Base Repair of up to 11" depth
Base Repair of 11-24" depth

. Cold Milli

Cold Milling, All Depths, County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement
Cold Milling, All Depths, Vendor removes Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

Commodities:

Asphalt

SCI1-Type 8
SC1-Type 2

CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt
Cold Mix Asphalt
BB1

Gravel

610 unwashed limestone aggregate
#7 washed limestone aggregate
#57 washed limestone aggregate
#89 washed limestone aggregate
#100 Rip Rap

#200 Rip Rap

#300 Rip Rap

Page 1 of 10



Washed Road Gravel
Clay Gravel

HDPE (Plastic Pipes)
12" diameter by fool

15" diameter by foot

18" diameter by foot

24" diameter by foot

30" diameter by foot
24”Band

30" Band

i 1 Type 2
24> diameter by foot
30” diameter by foot
24" Band
30” Band

Sealed Bids may be submitted by either of the following methods:
Sealed Bids will be accepted until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 18, 2022, by electronic

submission at http://www.madison-co.com/bids or in a sealed envelope at the Chancery

Cletk's Office, 125 West North Street, Canton, Mississippi.

Electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 18, 2022, as a PDF
file via Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids. Each bidder
submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's bid sheet as
part of its PDF bid submittal,

Non-electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on August 18, 2022 at the Madison
County Chancery Clerk's Office, Rooms 225-228,125 West North Street, Canton, MS
39046. All sealed bids submitted to the Chancery Clerk's office shall have the bidder's name
and the phrase “Term Bid” for which a bid is being submitted written on the outside face of
the envelope. If any envelope is not so marked, said bid shall not be opened and considered.
Each bidder submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's
bid sheet as part of its PDF bid submittal,
All bids must comply with the specifications provided. Madison County reserves the
right to amend the specifications, as necessary, and agrees to notify all who have
requested bid packets from the Madison County Board of Supervisors. No Guaranteed
Minimum,
ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED, DATED AND
SUBMITTED ON THE COUNTY FURNISHED BID FORMS

The Madison County Board of Supervisors reserves the right to reject any and all bids,
and to waive any informalities or irregularities in the bids received. For any questions
relating to the electronic submission process, please call Kesha Jackson at
601.855.5534.

Madison County Board of Supervisors
By: (s) Kesha Jackson, Purchase Clerk Publication Dates: J uly 21, 2022 & July 28, 2022

Madison County Journal
Page 2 of 10




Commodity Term Bid

Asphalt
L. Asphalt
a. SCI1-Typc 8 NO BID _ bid amount
b. SCl-Type2 NO BID __ bid amount
c. CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt $4.30/gal*** bid amount
d. Cold Mix Asphalt NOBID _ bid amount
c. BBl NO BID _ bid amount

(v")Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

***OPTION 1 - Fixed Pricing. Price will remain $4.30 delivered per gallon throughout bid term of
October 1, 2022 - September 30, 2023,

*“**OPTION 2 - Index Pricing. $3.3950 delivered per gallon tied to the August 2022 MS Index.
Pricing will adjust each month based on any changes in the Emulsified Asphalt
Index posted by MDOT each month. For example - if the Index price changes by
.05/gallon, then your price will change by the same amount for that month.

Quoted price includes delivery charge.
Demurrage: 2 hours free; $90/hr thereafter.

Initial ALW_Date 8/15/22

Page 6 of 10



h.

Commodity Term Bid

Gravel
Gravel
610 unwashed limestone aggregate
#7 washed limestone aggregate

#57 washed limestone aggregate

#89 washed limestone aggregate

#100 Rip Rap

#200 Rip Rap

#300 Rip Rap

Washed Road Gravel

Clay Gravel

bid amount

bid amount
bid amount
bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

v (v")Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial ALW Date 8/15/22

Page 7 of 10



4.

Commodity Term Bid

Aluminized CMP (Pipes) (14 Gauge Type 2

Aluminized CMP (Pipes) (14 Gauge Type 2)

24” diameter by foot bid amount
30” diameter by foot bid amount
24” Band bid amount
30” Band bid amount

v (v')Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial ALW Date 8/15/22

Page 9 of 10



For use in your calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the Number of
Miles from your Company Plant to the Madison County Road Department
Miles

NOTE: ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED
BY ANAUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a term bid by the Madison
County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the materials or services on this bid form,
that it will provide said materials or services in a timely manner at the awarded term bid
price for the duration of said term bid period. The company acknowledges there are

No Minimum Guarantees on any term bid. The below signed company further agrees
that it will not provide quantities of a materials or services in an amount greater than is
listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed
company agrees that if it does provide materials or services in an amount greater than
that listed on the purchase order, that it will not hold Madison County responsible for
the quantity of such materials or services that exceeds the purchase order amount.

Company Name: __ERGON ASPHALT & EMULSIONS

Address: P. O. BOX 1639
JACKSON, MS 39215-1639
Telephone #: 601-933-3000
Cell Phone#: 601-497-7278
Fax#: 601-933-3363
Email: amy.walker@ergon.com / teresa.purifoy@ergon.com
Authorized Representative’s Signatur. . ate 8/15/22

Print Authorized Representative’s Name_Amy L. Walker, Area Sales Manager

The specifications and bid forms for the above-listed term bids are on file and
open for public inspection at the Madison County Chancery Clerk's Office,
Rooms 225-228, and 125 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. A PDF copy of
the specifications and bid sheets may be procured, at no charge, by either of the
following methods:

. Download a copy from Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids

. Email arequest to kesha.jackson@madison-co.com

Initial_ALW Date 8/15/22

Page 10 of 10



Sealed bid for

Madison County Board of Supervisors
125 West North Street

Canton, MS 39046

October 1, 2022 - September 30,2023
By Dickerson & Bowen, Inc.

P.O. Box 1008

Brookhaven, MS 39602-1008
Certificate of Responsibility # 12

DICKERSON

BOWEN

A Elighway Consiruetem Campang
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MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
CONSTRUCTION SERVICE

TERM BIDS FOR PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2022-SEPTEMBER 30,2023
SPECIFICATIONS

ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITTALED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The Madison County Board of Supervisors will receive sealed bids for the following:

Construction Services:

Haul and Laydown of Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of SC-1, Type 8 Asphalt
Haul and Laydown of 9.5 mm Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of BB-I Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of 12 mm Asphalt

Road Base Repair

Base Repair of up to 11" depth
Base Repair of 11-24" depth

Cold Milling

Cold Milling, All Depths, County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement
Cold Milling, All Depths, Vendor removes Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

Commodities:

Asphal¢

SC1-Type 8
SC1-Type 2

CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt
Cold Mix Asphalt
BB1

Gravel

610unwashed limestone aggregate
#7 washed limestone aggregate
#57 washed limestone aggregate
#89 washed limestone aggregate
#100 Rip Rap

#200 Rip Rap

#300RipRap

Page 10f10
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Washed Road Gravel
Clay Gravel

HDPE (Plastic Pipes)

12" diameter by foot
15™ diameter by foot
18" diameter by foot

24" diameter by foot
30" diameter by foot
24"Band
30" Band

Aluminized CMP (Pipes) (14 Gauge Type 2)
24> diameter by foot

30" diameter by foot

24 Band

30” Band

Sealed Bids may be submitted by either of the following methods:

Sealed Bids will be accepted until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 18, 2022, by electronic
submission at http://www.madison-co.comvbids or in a sealed envelope at the Chancery
Clerk's Office, 125 West North Street, Canton, Mississippi.

Electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 18, 2022, as a PDF
file via Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids. Each bidder
submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's bid sheet as
part of its PDF bid submittal.

Non-electronic bids will be received until 10:00 2.m. on August 18, 2022 at the Madison
County Chancery Clerk's Office, Rooms 225-228,125 West North Street, Canton, MS
39046. All sealed bids submitted to the Chancery Clerk's office shall have the bidder's name
and the phrase “Term Bid” for which a bid is being submitted written on the outside face of
the envelope. If any envelope is not so marked, said bid shall not be opened and considered.
Each bidder submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's
bid sheet as part of its PDF bid submittal.
All bids must comply with the specifications provided. Madison County reserves the
right to amend the specifications, as necessary, and agrees to notify all who have
requested bid packets from the Madison County Board of Supervisors. No Guaranteed
Minimum.
ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED, DATED AND
SUBMITTED ON THE COUNTY FURNISHED BID FORMS

The Madison County Board of Supervisors reserves the right to reject any and all bids,
and to waive any informalities or irregularities in the bids received. For any questions
relating to the electronic submission process, please call Kesha Jackson at
601.855.5534.

Madison County Board of Supervisors
By: (s) Kesha Jackson, Purchase Clerk Publication Dates: July 21, 2022 & July 28, 2022

Madison County Journal

Page 2 of 10




1

Asphalt

SC1-Type 8
SC1-Type 2

CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt
Cold Mix Asphalt

BBI

Commodity Term Bid

Asphalt

w bid amount
$89.90  pid amount
NoBid  bjd amount
$160.00  pid amount
$83.35 bid amount

(v )yMark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

nitia) B5E Dare 8/18/2022

Page 6 of 10



Commodity Term Bid

Gravel

. Gravel

. 610unwashed limestone aggregate

. #7washed limestone aggregate

. #57 washed limestone aggregate

. #89 washed limestone aggregate

. #100Rip Rap

#200 Rip Rap

. #300Rip Rap

. Washed Road Gravel

Clay Gravel

No Bid

No Bid
__NoBid__

No Bid
_NoBid _

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

_ bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

‘/(/ yMark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial {7(/ Date 8/18/2022

Page 70f10



. HDPE (Plastic Pipes)
12” diameter by foot

. 15” diameter by foot

18” diameter by foot

. 24” diameter by foot
. 30" diameter by foot
24”Band

. 30”Band

Commodity Term Bid

HDPE (Plastic Pipes

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

/ (v")Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

mitial YL Date 8182022

Page 8 of 10



Commodity Term Bid

Aluminized CMP (Pipes) (14 Gauge Type 2)

. 24” diameter by foot

. 30” diameter by foot

. 24” Band

. 30” Band

14 2

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

‘/ (v")Mark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Initial ﬁ VDale 8/18/2022

Page 9 of 10



For use in your calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the Number of
Miles from your Company Plant to the Madison County Road Department
28 Miles

NOTE: ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED
BY ANAUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a term bid by the Madison
County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the materials or services on this bid form,
that it will provide said materials or services in a timely manner at the awarded term bid
price for the duration of said term bid period. The company acknowledges there are

No Minimum Guarantees on any term bid. The below signed company further agrees
that it will not provide quantities of a materials or services in an amount greater than is
listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed
company agrees that if it does provide materials or services in an amount greater than
that listed on the purchase order, that it will not hold Madison County responsible for
the quantity of such materials or services that exceeds the purchase order amount.

Company Name: Dickerson & Bowen, Inc.

Address: P.O. Box 1008
Brookhaven, MS 39602-1008

Telephone #: _601-869-2002

Cell Phone#:  601-754-2795
Fax¥: 601-969-2004

Email: ___ pclarke@dickersonandbowen.com
Authorized Representative’s Signature Mﬂ— Date 8/18/2022

Print Authorized Representative’s Name__Blake Clarke

The specifications and bid forms for the above-listed term bids are on file and
open for public inspection at the Madison County Chancery Clerk's Office,
Rooms 225-228, and 125 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. A PDF copy of
the specifications and bid sheets may be procured, at no charge, by either of the
following methods:

. Download a copy from Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids

. Email arequest to kesha.jackson@madison-co.com

nitial 2C~ Date 8/18/2022

Page 10 of 10
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MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
CONSTRUCTION SERVICES

TERMBIDS FORPERIODOCTOBER 1,2022-SEPTEMBER 30,2023
SPECIFICATIONS

ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The Madison County Board of Supervisors will receive sealed bids for the following:

Construction Services:

Haul and Laydown of Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of SC-I, Type 8 Asphalt
Haul and Laydown of 9.5 mm Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of BB-I Asphalt

Haul and Laydown of 12mm Asphalt

Road Base Repair

Base Repair of up to I'1" depth
Base Repair of 11-24" depth

Cold Mill

Cold Milling, All Depths, County keeps Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement
Cold Milling, All Depths, Vendor removes Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement

Commodities:
Asphalt

SC1-Type 8
SC1-Type 2

CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt
Cold Mix Asphalt
BBI

Gravel

610 unwashed limestone aggregate
#7 washed limestone aggregate
#57 washed limestone aggregatc
#89 washed limestone aggregate
#100Rip Rap

#200 Rip Rap

#300Rip Rap

Page 1 of 10
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Washed Road Gravel
Clay Gravel

HDPE (Plasti Pipes)
12” diameter by foot
15” diameter by foot
18" diameter by foot

24” diameter by foot
30" diameter by foot
24" Band
30”Band

Aluminized CMP (Pipes) (14 G Type 2)
24” diameter by foot

30” diameter by foot
24” Band
30” Band

Sealed Bids may be submitted by either of the following methods:

Sealed Bids will be accepted until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 18, 2022, by electronic
submission at http://www.madison-co.com/bids or in a sealed envelope at the Chancery
Clerk's Office, 125 West North Street, Canton, Mississippi.

Electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on Thursday, August 18, 2022, as a PDF
file via Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids. Each bidder
submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's bid sheet as
part of its PDF bid submittal.

Non-electronic bids will be received until 10:00 a.m. on August 18, 2022 at the Madison
County Chancery Clerk's Office, Rooms 225-228,125 West North Street, Canton, MS
39046. All sealed bids submitted to the Chancery Clerk's office shall have the bidder's name
and the phrase “Term Bid” for which a bid is being submitted written on the outside face of
the envelope. If any envelope is not so marked, said bid shall not be opened and considered.
Each bidder submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's
bid sheet as part of its PDF bid submittal.
All bids must comply with the specifications provided. Madison County reserves the
right to amend the specifications, as necessary, and agrees to notify all who have
requested bid packets from the Madison County Board of Supervisors. No Guaranteed
Minimum.
ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED, DATED AND
SUBMITTED ON THE COUNTY FURNISHED BID FORMS

The Madison County Board of Supervisors reserves the right to reject any and all bids,
and to waive any informalities or irregularities in the bids received. For any questions
relating to the electronic submission process, please call Kesha Jackson at
601.855.5534.

Madison County Board of Supervisors
By: (s) Kesha Jackson, Purchase Clerk Publication Dates: July 21, 2022 & July 28, 2022

Madison County Journal
Page 2 of 10



1.

Commodity Term Bid

Asphalt
Asphalt
SC1-Type 8
SC1-Type 2

CRS 2-Liquid Asphalt
Cold Mix Asphalt

BB1

-
Initia Datcg IS [T

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

\/(w/ yMark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Page 6 of 10
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Commodity Term Bid

Gravel

Gravel

610 unwashed limestone aggregate

#7 washed limestone aggregate
#57 washed limestone aggregate
#89 washed limestone aggregate
#100 Rip Rap

#200 Rip Rap

#300 Rip Rap

Washed Road Gravel

Clay Gravel

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

bid amount

k/( v )yMark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

Ini%/ Date 5‘4 .L.-t 20 L,I/

Page 7 of 10



d.

Commodity Term Bid

HDPE (Plastic Pipes)

HDPE (Plastic Pipes)

12 diameter by foot [2.23  bid amount
15” diameter by foot [%.58  bid amount
18” diameter by foot [7.-32  bid amount
24" diameter by foot hg 5‘;{ bid amount
307 diameter by foot '-H .29 vid amount
24" Band .00 bid amount
30" Band [55.00  bid amount

(v yMark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

l-i%; Daleglfgl’w’[/’l/

Page 8 of 10



d.

Commodity Term Bid

Aluminized CMP (Pipes) (14 Gauge Type 2)

\luminized CMP (Piges) (14 G Type 2

24” diameter by foot 5 L Sff bid amount

30” diameter by foot (S, 47~ bid amount

24" Band W12 [ J0C 79.51 /157,0%id amount
(t'w'fl(/ ‘L'uc'ﬂ'c)

30” Band M ll/lO Lo dﬁ{.L’;Z/?((!’Mrbid amount

(f’w-n(/f"u/‘ﬂf)

(v")yMark here to indicate NO Bid submitted for this category.

( /{
N@L Daed[lS [U TV
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For use in your calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the Number of
Miles from your Company Plant to the Madison County Road Department

—

[S Miles

NOTE: ALL BID FORMS MUST BE SIGNED, INITIALED AND DATED
BY ANAUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a term bid by the Madison
County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the materials or services on this bid form,
that it will provide said materials or services in a timely manner at the awarded term bid
price for the duration of said term bid period. The company acknowledges there are

No Minimum Guarantees on any term bid. The below signed company further agrees
that it will not provide quantitics of a materials or services in an amount greater than is
listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed
company agrees that if it does provide materials or services in an amount greater than
that listed on the purchase order, that it will not hold Madison County responsible for
the quantity of such materials or services that exceeds the purchase order amount.

Company Name: (=40 5/;90(9
Address: 20S7 ForesT AUQ

JRekson mMmS 3900
Telephone #: (/0| 4 526
Cell Phonet: (0] 47/ §2%
Fax: ol pog 781Y
Email: d/{)macﬁuzi{zﬂ @ avsupplymg.cor~ .

: e o

Authorized Representative’s Signature Date 8//$ 2207«2/
Print Authorized Representative’s Name /DA S JA @Mﬂm

The specifications and bid forms for the above-listed term bids are on file and
open for public inspection at the Madison County Chancery Clerk's Office,
Rooms 225-228, and 125 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. A PDF copy of
the specifications and bid sheets may be procured, at no charge, by either of the
following methods:

Download a copy from Madison County's website at http://www.madison-co.com/bids

Email arequest to kesha jackson@madison-co.com

Inng/# Date 8/13// i g B
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SOUTHERN

PIPE & SUPPLY

354 US Hwy 49 Frontage Road - Richland, MS 39218
Phone: 601.826.1700 - Fax: 601.826.1701

LEGAL ENTITY: Madison County, MS
BID TERM: 10/1/2022 thru 9/30/2023
BID DATE: 8/18/2022

AASHTO SPECIFICATIONS FOR ADS N-12 PIPE & COUPLINGS
( NEW - VIRGIN RESIN & RECYCLED RESIN & HP PIPE )
1. AASHTO M-252, Standard specification for polyethylene corrugated drainage tubing, 4"-10" diameter
2. AASHTO M-294, Standard specification for corrugated polyethylene pipe, 12"-60" diameter
3. Resin cell class shall be 424420C for 4"-10" pipe and 435400C for 12"-60" pipe
4. ASTM F-477 Specification for elastometric seals (gaskets) for joining plastic pipe
5. Pipe lengths available: (8"-60" 20" sections) (8"-60" 24' sections) (8"-60" 30" sections) (12"-60" w/bell & Spigot)

~

~

Smooth Interior Double Wall Hi;gh Density Polyethylene Pipe - Brand Name "N-12"

Diameter| ASTM AASHTO | Per | Coupling | Per HP Per
(inches) | Pipe Cost | Pipe Cost | Unit| Cost Unit | Pipe Cost| Unit
8" $6.51 $6.85 |foot| $9.00 |Each foot
10" $9.77 $10.29 |foot| $11.00 |Each foot
12" $12.23 $12.87 |foot| $28.00 |Each| $ 13.48 | foot
15" $13.58 $14.29 |foot| $35.00 |Each| $ 16.85| foot
18" $17.38 $18.30 |foot| $55.00 |Each|$ 23.60| foot
24" $29.34 $30.88 |foot| $80.00 |[Each|$ 33.71| foot
30" $41.29 $43.47 |foot| $155.00 |Each| $ 51.69 | foot
36" $52.16 $54.91 |foot| $195.00 |Each| $ 70.79 | foot
42" $66.84 $70.35 |foot| $250.00 |Each| $ 87.64 | foot
48" $84.23 $88.66 |foot| $275.00 |Each| $119.10 | foot
60" $145.10 | $152.73 | foot| $350.00 |Each| $160.67 | foot

1. These prices include freight to any location per county request.

Taid (ol

David Cole - Outside Salesman
Southern pipe & Supply

Cell: 601.613.4022
david.cole@southernpipe.com




SOUTHERN

PIPE & SUPPLY

354 US Hwy 49 Frontage Road - Richland, MS 39218
Phone: 601.826.1700 - Fax: 601.826.1701

LEGAL ENTITY: Madison County, MS
BID TERM: 10/1/2022 thru 9/30/2023
BID DATE: 8/18/2022

AASHTO SPECIFICATIONS FOR ADS N-12 PIPE & COUPLINGS
( NEW - VIRGIN RESIN & RECYCLED RESIN & HP PIPE )
1. AASHTO M-252, Standard specification for polyethylene corrugated drainage tubing, 4"-10" diameter
2. AASHTO M-294, Standard specification for corrugated polyethylene pipe, 12"-60" diameter
3. Resin cell class shall be 424420C for 4"-10" pipe and 435400C for 12"-60" pipe
4. ASTM F-477 Specification for elastometric seals (gaskets) for joining plastic pipe
5. Pipe lengths available: (8"-60" 20' sections) (8"-60" 24" sections) (8"-60" 30" sections) (12"-60" w/bell & Spigot)

Smooth Interior Double Wall High Density Polyethylene Pipe - Brand Name "N-12"

Diameter| ASTM AASHTO | Per | Coupling | Per HP Per
(inches) | Pipe Cost | Pipe Cost | Unit| Cost | Unit | Pipe Cost| Unit
8" $6.51 $6.85 |foot| $9.00 |Each foot
10" $9.77 $10.29 |foot| $11.00 |Each foot
12" $12.23 $12.87 |foot| $28.00 |Each|$ 13.48 | foot
15" $13.58 $14.29 |foot| $35.00 |Each|$ 16.85| foot
18" $17.38 $18.30 |foot| $55.00 |Each|$ 23.60| foot
24" $29.34 $30.88 |foot| $80.00 |Each| $ 33.71| foot
30" $41.29 $43.47 |foot| $155.00 |Each| $§ 51.69 | foot
36" $52.16 $54.91 |foot| $195.00 |Each| S 70.79 | foot
42" $66.84 $70.35 |foot| $250.00 |Each| S 87.64 | foot
48" $84.23 $88.66 |foot| $275.00 |Each| $119.10 | foot
60" $145.10 | $152.73 | foot| $350.00 |Each| $160.67 | foot

Tosd  Cole

1. These prices include freight to any location per county request.

Pavid Cole - Outside Salesman
Southern pipe & Supply
Cell: 601.613.4022

david.cole@southernpipe.com




| Madison County

Bid Date: August 18, 2022
Bid Term: 10-1-2022 thru 9-30-23
Project #: TBD
Distributor Cost
County Bid
Size ASTM Pipe Price
8" $6.51 $5.99
10" $9.77 $8.99
12" $12.23 $11.25
15" $13.58 $12.49
18" $17.38 $15.99
24" $29.34 $26.99
30" $41.29 $37.99
36" $52.16 $47.99
42" $66.84 $61.49
48" $84.23 $77.49
60" $145.10 $133.49
“Distributor Cost
County Bid
Size | AASHTO Pipe Price
g 3685 6.31
10" $10.29 $9.46
12" | $12.87 $11.84 |
G $14.29 $13.15 |
18" $18.30 $16.83 |
24 ~$30.88 28.41
30" | $43.47 $39.99 |
36" $54.91 $50.52 |
42" $70.35 64.73
48" $88.66 ~$81.57 |
60" |  $152.73 $140.52 |

10f4



Madison County

Bid Date: August 18, 2022
Bid Term: 10-1-2022 thru 9-30-23
Project #: TBD
County $ Coupler [ Distributor Price
8" $9.00 E 8.10
10" $11.00| $_ 9.90 |
12" | $28.00 | $ 25.20 |
15" $35.00 $ 3150
18" $55.00 $ 4950
- 24" $80.00 $ 72.00
30" $155.00 $ 139.50 |
36" ~$195.00 $ 17550 |
42" | $250.00 $ 225.00
48" $275.00 $ 24750
60" $350.00 $  315.00 |

20f4




HP PIPE

HP PIPE Distributor Cost
County Bid

Size HP Pipe Price

12" $13.48 $12.00
15" $16.85 $15.00
18" $23.60 $21.00
24" $33.71 $30.00
30" $51.69 $46.00
36" $70.79 $63.00
42" $87.64 $78.00
48" $119.10 $106.00
60" $160.67 $143.00
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Madison County CMP Bid C%%NTECH®

Pricing effective in Madison County, MS ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS
Sales Engineer: Wes Klepzig
Bid Date: August 18, 2022 Customer Svc Coordinator; Jim Schmidt
Phone: 972-580-2007
Aluminized
DIA Corrugation Gage Round
24 2-2/3x1/2 14 $52.34
30 2-23 x 112 14 $65.42

n/a = configuration not available due fo structural or menufacturing limitations
Bands: 10C = 3 ft of pipe of same dia
Freight: PICKED UP AT PLANT Freight allowed for min loads of $8000 delivered to a single drop point.
Loads less than $8000 and loads with more than one drop, subject to additional freight charges.
Delivery Schedule: Schedule to be determined at time of order. LTL shipments subject to scheduling with other loads.

Taxes: Taxes not included. Add when applicable
Terms: SUBJECT TO CONTECH'S STANDARD TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SALE

SOUTHERN PIPE & SUPPLY CO., INC.
354 U'S HWY 49 FRONTAGE ROAD
RICHLAND, MS 39218

SOUI/I\Q/LH p’ Pe
Taod Cole



